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Raptor Financial Technologies Expands India Presence Through 
Strategic Partnership with OmneNEST Technologies 

Tokyo & Mumbai | 23 July 2025 — Raptor Financial Technologies (“Raptor”), a leading provider of 
low-latency market gateway and pre-trade risk management solutions, today announced a strategic 
partnership with OmneNEST Technologies (“OmneNEST”) to strengthen and expand its footprint in 
India’s rapidly evolving securities industry. 

Raptor enables investment banks and proprietary trading firms to connect their low-latency, high-
value order flows to stock exchanges across India and APAC, while ensuring full regulatory 
compliance. Trusted by top-tier global trading firms, Raptor consistently delivers nanosecond to 
microsecond-level performance and offers comprehensive pre-trade risk controls to meet stringent 
local regulatory standards and uphold market integrity.  
 
OmneNEST is a leading provider of multi-asset trading technology in India’s securities industry. 
Through this partnership, OmneNEST, an exchange-empanelled vendor, will deliver Raptor’s market 
gateway and risk management solution to India brokers and trading desks as part of a unified, 
exchange-empanelled, and locally supported offering. Together, Raptor and OmneNEST offer trading 
firms a fully integrated experience, combining local accountability, simplified engagement, and 
access to proven technology tailored to India’s unique regulatory and operational trading 
environment. 

With over 12 years of experience servicing high-volume order flows in India, Raptor supports all 
major exchanges, including NSE, BSE, MCX, NSE IX, and India INX, across cash equities, listed 
derivatives, and other asset classes.  

William Dallyn, Global Sales Director at Raptor, said: “We are delighted to partner with OmneNEST 
and make Raptor even more accessible to trading firms in India. This collaboration brings our 
globally proven, low-latency solution together with trusted, local delivery. For India brokers and 
trading desks, that means faster onboarding, simplified operations, and a single point of contact 
while maintaining the highest standards of performance and compliance.” 

Paresh Hede, Chief Executive Officer at OmneNEST, added: “Our clients are looking for speed, 
compliance and operational resilience they can rely on every trading day. Raptor has proven low-
latency capabilities across India and the major APAC markets. Our partnership allows us to offer best 
in class technology, fully supported on the ground in India, and integrated into our complete trading 
technology ecosystem.” 

For more information about Raptor’s low-latency market gateway and pre-trade risk management 
solutions, visit www.raptorfintech.com/raptor.  
  

https://www.raptorfintech.com/raptor
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About Raptor Financial Technologies 

Raptor Financial Technologies Co., Ltd., is a leading provider of ultra-low latency market gateway 
and pre-trade risk management solutions, serving the Asia-Pacific securities industry. Raptor 
provides investment banks and proprietary trading firms with fast, resilient, and scalable market 
access and risk management, delivering consistent performance and integration to exchanges across 
the region. With dedicated local development and support teams, and deep domain expertise in 
financial markets and mission-critical systems, Raptor delivers the responsive, face-to-face expertise 
clients expect and value. 

Learn more: www.raptorfintech.com 

 

About OmneNEST Technologies 

OmneNEST Technologies Private Limited is a leading provider of multi-asset trading technology and 
managed services to India’s securities industry. With a proven reputation for local-market expertise, 
OmneNEST delivers comprehensive solutions for broker-dealers, proprietary trading firms, 
institutional desks, and retail brokers, supporting clients throughout India with a responsive service 
and deep regulatory understanding. 

Learn more: www.omnenest.com 

 

Further Enquiries 

• Raptor Financial Technologies — info@raptorfintech.com 
• OmneNEST Technologies — sales@omnenest.com 
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